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Gitu Nijhawan <gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Fwd: HTBF_Scholarship, Laptop, and Smart Vision Glass Recipients
Varun Gautam <gtmvrn@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 21, 2025 at 2:
To: gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in

Varun Gautam
Associate Professor 
Department of Commerce 
PGDAV College
University of Delhi 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Dhiraj Patel <dhiraj@helptheblind.in>
Date: 17 October 2023 at 10:04:45 AM IST
To: Varun Gautam <gtmvrn@gmail.com>
Cc: Pooja Bomb <pooja@helptheblind.in>, Jyothi Gupta <jyothi@helptheblind.in>, Ashuwang Gangmei <ashuwang@helptheblind.in>, Aishwarya Dharmik
<aishwarya@helptheblind.in>
Subject: HTBF_Scholarship, Laptop, and Smart Vision Glass Recipients

Dear Mr. Varun Sir,

I am writing to provide an update on the candidates who have received various forms of support from Help the Blind Foundation. We have made a
significant impact on both existing and current batches, and I would like to share the details with you.

Batch 2022-2024 (Existing Batch)

Scholarship Recipients:

SUBODH BHANDARI

Krishna Kumar

Lal Bahadur Singh

MANJEET KUMAR

SHISHU SINGH

Batch 2021-2023 (Current Batch)

Scholarship Recipients:

Mudit

Nikhil Yadav

Lallo Prasad Yadav

Ashish

Ritesh Kumar

(Note: The above five candidates have also received keyboards and OTG devices from Help the Blind Foundation as part of their support.)

Laptop Recipients:

Raja

Rajat Panchal

Vicky Raj

Rupesh

Manjit

Subodh

Sishu Singh

Shubham

Lal Bahadur Singh

Khusboo

Smart Vision Glass Recipients:

Raja

Rajat Panchal

Vicky Raj

Rupesh

Manjit

Subodh

Sishu Singh

Our foundation has been unwavering in its commitment to providing these individuals with the necessary tools and resources to make a positive difference
in their lives. We firmly believe that these initiatives are pivotal in empowering them to pursue their educational and career aspirations effectively.

If you have any questions or require further information regarding these recipients or our foundation's activities, please feel free to contact me. We eagerly
anticipate your continued support and guidance in our mission to assist the visually impaired.
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Thank you for your time and consideration.

Sincerely,

Dhiraj Kr. Patel
Team Lead

Help the Blind Foundation
Contact No. 9335186607
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PROFORMA INVOICE

Saktek  Foundation (F/Y 2024-25)
486, Double Story
New Rajinder Nagar
New Delhi
GSTIN/UIN: 07AAZCS3784P1Z1
State Name :  Delhi, Code : 07
CIN: U85190DL2017NPL325172
E-Mail : info@saktek.org

Consignee
Principal PGDAV college (Morning)
Delhi
M: 8510069337


State Name : Delhi, Code : 07

Buyer (if other than consignee)
Principal PGDAV college (Morning)
Delhi
M: 8510069337


State Name : Delhi, Code : 07

Invoice No.
DL/24-25/0049
Delivery Note

Supplier’s Ref.

Buyer’s Order No.

Despatch Document No.

Despatched through

Dated
25-Apr-2024
Mode/Terms of Payment

Other Reference(s)

Dated

Delivery Note Date

Destination

Terms of Delivery

Sl Description of Goods AmountDisc. %perRateQuantityHSN/SAC
No.

1 Orbit20 from APH 45,500.00Nos.45,500.001.000 Nos.8471500

CGST  2.5%  (Output) 1,137.50%2.50
SGST  2.5%  (Output) 1,137.50%2.50

Total  47,775.001.000 Nos.

Amount Chargeable (in words) E. & O.E
INR Forty Seven Thousand Seven Hundred Seventy Five Only

HSN/SAC TotalState TaxCentral TaxTaxable
Tax AmountAmountRateAmountRateValue

8471500 2,275.001,137.502.50%1,137.502.50%45,500.00
Total 2,275.001,137.501,137.5045,500.00

Tax Amount (in words)  : INR Two Thousand Two Hundred Seventy Five Only

Company’s PAN : AAZCS3784P

Declaration
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the 
goods described and that all particulars are true and correct.

Company’s Bank Details
Bank Name : HDFC Bank Ltd
A/c No. : 50200028083717
Branch & IFS Code : New Rajinder Nagar & HDFC0001563

for Saktek  Foundation (F/Y 2024-25)

Authorised Signatory

This is a Computer Generated Invoice



Gitu Nijhawan <gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Fwd: Quotation for orbit 20
Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 21, 2025 at 9:30 PM
To: gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Date: Tue, Jan 21, 2025, 9:06 PM
Subject: Fwd: Quotation for orbit 20
To: Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com>

Regards,
Dr. Ritu Gupta
Prof.(Asst), PGDAV College.
Delhi University
8510069337

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Kavita gurung <kavita@saksham.org>
Date: Thu, Apr 25, 2024 at 12:26 PM
Subject: Fwd: Quotation for orbit 20
To: <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Cc: Vikas Kakkar <vikas@saksham.org>, Technology Store <techstore@saksham.org>

Dear Ma'am,

Please find the attached Proforma Invoice. 

--
Thanks & Regards.

 " - Kavita Bhandari - "
T: +91-011-42411015 
E:- kavita@saksham.org | www.saksham.org
SAKSHAM 
486, Double Storey, New Rajinder Nagar, New Delhi- 110060
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Facebook icon  Twitter icon  Youtbue icon  Instagram icon
Any donations made to Saksham are tax-exempt under 80G of the IT Act | We are permitted under FCRA for
receiving foreign donations.

Saktek Online Store- SHOP NOW 
A Unique Online Shopping Platform for persons with sight loss and
vision impairment- Saksham's Technology Store.  
Saktek Foundation- Discover your capabilities here.

www.saktek.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Info <info@saktek.in>
Date: Wed, Apr 24, 2024 at 1:02 PM
Subject: Fwd: Quotation for orbit 20
To: kavita <kavita@saksham.org>
Cc: vikas <vikas@saksham.org>

fyi

============ Forwarded message ============
From: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
To: <info@saktek.in>
Date: Wed, 24 Apr 2024 08:53:09 +0530
Subject: Quotation for orbit 20
============ Forwarded message ============

Dear seller,
I am nodal officer in PGDAV college. I want to have quotation for orbit 20 for our differently abled students. Please
provide me the same.

Thank you
Dr. Ritu Gupta 
Nodal officer
PGDAV( morning)
8510069337

--
Thanks & Regards.

 " - Kavita Bhandari - "
T: +91-011-42411015 
E:- kavita@saksham.org | www.saksham.org
SAKSHAM 
486, Double Storey, New Rajinder Nagar, New Delhi- 110060
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Facebook icon  Twitter icon  Youtbue icon  Instagram icon
Any donations made to Saksham are tax-exempt under 80G of the IT Act | We are permitted under FCRA for
receiving foreign donations.

Saktek Online Store- SHOP NOW 
A Unique Online Shopping Platform for persons with sight loss and
vision impairment- Saksham's Technology Store.  
Saktek Foundation- Discover your capabilities here.

www.saktek.in
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Gitu Nijhawan <gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Fwd: Request for donation for wheelchairs
Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 21, 2025 at 9:31 PM
To: gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Date: Tue, Jan 21, 2025, 9:01 PM
Subject: Fwd: Request for donation for wheelchairs
To: Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com>

Regards,
Dr. Ritu Gupta
Prof.(Asst), PGDAV College.
Delhi University
8510069337

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ravinder Agarwal <skagarwalandco@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, May 13, 2024 at 12:46 PM
Subject: Re: Request for donation for wheelchairs
To: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Dear Madam

We would be happy to contribute towards the social cause. It will,
however, not be possible for us to donate in kind.

May I therefore, request you to kindly share the account details and
amount to be transferred. for procuring the wheelchairs.

Regards.

S.K. Agarwal & Co
Advocates and Legal Consultants

On Sun, May 12, 2024 at 9:45 PM Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in> wrote:
>
>  Dear Sir,
>
> The PGDAV (M) College's enabling unit (PWD) is currently setting up a lab for students with disabilities. The lab will
facilitate students with disabilities to enhance their employability and increase mobility. This initiative will help the
social inclusion of students in the mainstream.    For the reason mentioned above, society's assistance is also
essential.
> These are the things that we require.
>
> 1. Laptops - 15 in numbers
> 2. KEBO device - 1 in number
> 3. Orbit 20 device - 4 in numbers
> 4. Folding walking sticks for blind students- 25 in numbers
> 5. Smart Vision Glasses- 10 in numbers
> 6. Wheelchairs - 2 in numbers
> 7. Disabled-friendly software
>
> I request you to facilitate the required resources mentioned in item number 6 specifically. Donations can be in
monetary form or kind.
>
> Thanks in anticipation,
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> Dr. Ritu Gupta
> Nodal Officer, PWD
> PGDAV(M) College.
> Delhi University
> 8510069337
>
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Gitu Nijhawan <gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Fwd: Request for donation of folding walking sticks for blinds
Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 21, 2025 at 9:29 PM
To: gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Date: Tue, Jan 21, 2025, 9:07 PM
Subject: Fwd: Request for donation of folding walking sticks for blinds
To: Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com>

Regards,
Dr. Ritu Gupta
Prof.(Asst), PGDAV College.
Delhi University
8510069337

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Jaideep Gupta <lifelinecarea16@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, May 8, 2024 at 10:31 PM
Subject: Re: Request for donation of folding walking sticks for blinds
To: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Respected ma'am,
We're hereby pleased by your initiative for the social inclusion of visually handicapped in the mainstream. 
We are hereby donating folding sticks for the same however due to lack of availability we're able to provide only 12
sticks as of now. Hopefully we will work for more such initiatives in the future. 

Jaideep Gupta 
Life Line Care 

On Wed, 8 May, 2024, 19:40 Ritu Gupta, <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

  The PGDAV (M) College's enabling unit (PWD) is currently setting up a lab for students with disabilities. For the
aforementioned reason, society's assistance is also essential. These are the things that we require.
 
1. Laptops - 15 in numbers
2. KEBO device - 1 in number
3. Orbit 20 device - 2 in numbers
4. Folding walking sticks for blind students- 25 in numbers
5. Smart Vision Glasses- 10 in numbers
6. Wheelchairs - 2 in numbers
7. Disabled-friendly software

I would like to request you to facilitate the required resources mentioned as item number 4 specifically. Donations
can be in monetary form or kind.

Thanks in anticipation,
Dr. Ritu Gupta
Nodal Officer, PWD
PGDAV(M) College.
Delhi University
8510069337
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Gitu Nijhawan <gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in>

Fwd: Request to Allow Students to Attend Smart Vision Pro Programme by HTBF
Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 21, 2025 at 9:31 PM
To: gitu.nijhawan@pgdav.du.ac.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ritu Gupta <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Date: Tue, Jan 21, 2025, 8:58 PM
Subject: Fwd: Request to Allow Students to Attend Smart Vision Pro Programme by HTBF
To: Ritu Gupta <ritugupta1009@gmail.com>

Regards,
Dr. Ritu Gupta
Prof.(Asst), PGDAV College.
Delhi University
8510069337

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Pgdav College <pgdavcollege.edu@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, May 9, 2024 at 10:27 AM
Subject: Fwd: Request to Allow Students to Attend Smart Vision Pro Programme by HTBF
To: <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Aishwarya Dharmik <aishwarya@helptheblind.in>
Date: Wed, May 1, 2024 at 3:37 PM
Subject: Request to Allow Students to Attend Smart Vision Pro Programme by HTBF
To: <pgdavcollege.edu@gmail.com>, <ritu.gupta@pgdav.du.ac.in>
Cc: Pooja Bomb <pooja@helptheblind.in>, Dhiraj Patel <dhiraj@helptheblind.in>, Jyothi Gupta
<jyothi@helptheblind.in>, Khushboo Parwana <khushboo@helptheblind.in>, Harshith Goyal
<harshith@helptheblind.in>

Dear Sir/Madam,

 

Warm greetings,

I hope this message finds you well. I am writing to inform you that a Smart Vision Glass Pro event is scheduled on 6th
and 7th May 2024. Students from our current batch 23-25 have been selected, and we are distributing Smart Vision
Glass.

The candidates' names are as follows:

Ashish

Lallo Prasad Yadav

Nikhil Yadav

Ritesh Kumar

 

We kindly request you to allow these students to attend this event.
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We look forward to your positive response.

 

Thanks and regards,

Aishwarya

Skill Development Trainer

Help The Blind Foundation

Phone: 7694876412

Email: aishwarya@helptheblind.in
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